
Solicitation 47

Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

357 Magnum, 125gr, JHP Remington
R29401 / 

500
405.00$        No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

90515 / 500 373.92$      Winchester X3576P / 500 255.46$        

357 SIG, 125gr, JHP, 

Training Ammo No Bid Speer
53919 / 

1,000
370.00$        Federal

AE357SA / 

1,000
439.00$         

Hornady 

Training
91298 / 500 276.36$      Winchester

USA357SJHP / 

500
265.85$        

357 SIG, 125gr, JHP, 

Bonded
No Bid Speer

53918 / 

1,000
425.00$        No Bid

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

91295 / 500 368.59$      Winchester
RA357SSB / 

500
361.37$        

38 Special, 130gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE38K / 1,000 415.00$         No Bid Winchester Q4171 / 500 162.17$        

38 Special, 125gr, +P, JHP Remington 29431 / 500 295.00$        Speer
53720 / 

1,000
485.00$        No Bid

Hornady 

Critical 

Defense

90311 / 250 237.02$      Winchester X38S7PH / 500 198.73$        

38 Special, Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester 38SBLP / 2,000 1,060.00$     

9mm Luger, 115gr, FMJ No Bid Speer
5200 / 

1,000
259.00$        Federal AE9DP / 1,000 259.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 

Training

90249 / 500 DiscontinuedWinchester Q4172 / 500 126.03$        

9mm Luger, 124gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo No Bid Speer
53651 / 

1,000
259.00$        Federal AE9AP / 1,000 259.00$         

Hornady 

Training
90238 / 500 200.95$      Winchester USA9MM / 500 128.59$        

9mm Luger, 124gr, JHP Remington 29357 / 500 285.00$        Speer
53618 / 

1,000
410.00$        Federal

P9HST1 / 

1,000
410.00$         

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

90235 / 500 289.72$      No Bid

9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, 

JHP
Remington 29358 / 500 285.00$        No Bid Federal

P9HST3 / 

1,000
410.00$         

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

90215 / 500 289.72$      Winchester
RA9124TP / 

500
188.86$        

9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, 

JHP, Bonded
Remington 29351 / 500 375.00$        Speer

53617 / 

1,000
410.00$        No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9BA / 500 237.05$        

9mm Luger, 147gr, JHP, 

Bonded
Remington 29353 / 500 375.00$        Speer

53619 / 

1,000
410.00$        No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9B / 500 240.98$        

10mm Semi-auto, 180gr, 

FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE10A / 1,000 475.00$         No Bid Winchester
USA10MM / 

500
241.38$        

40 S&W,165gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo No Bid Speer
53955 / 

1,000
295.00$        Federal

AE40R3 / 

1,000
315.00$         No Bid Winchester

USA40SW / 

500
144.10$        

Description

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

1
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Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

40 S&W,165gr, JHP Remington
R29429 / 

500
316.00$        No Bid Federal

P40HST3 / 

1,000
450.00$         No Bid Winchester RA40TA / 500 210.39$        

40 S&W,165gr, JHP, 

Bonded
Remington 29366 / 500 396.00$        Speer

53970 / 

1,000
440.00$        No Bid No Bid Winchester RA40BA / 500 258.83$        

40 S&W, 180gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo
No Bid Speer

53652 / 

1,000
295.00$        Federal

AE40R1 / 

1,000
315.00$         

Hornady 

Training
91374 / 500 239.76$      Winchester Q4238 / 500 150.98$        

40 S&W 180gr, JHP Remington
R29430 / 

500
316.00$        No Bid Federal

P40HST1 / 

1,000
450.00$         

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

91375 / 500 305.78$      Winchester RA40T / 500 211.49$        

40 S&W 180gr, JHP, 

Bonded
Remington 29436 / 500 396.00$        Speer

53962 / 

1,000
470.00$        No Bid No Bid Winchester RA40B / 500 255.95$        

45 Auto, 185gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester USA45A / 500 169.24$        

45 Auto, 185gr, +P, JHP Remington 29457 / 500 350.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 Auto, 185gr, +P, JHP, 

Bonded

45 Auto, 230gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo
No Bid Speer

53653 / 

1,000
389.00$        Federal AE45A / 1,000 389.00$         

Hornady 

Training
90924 / 500 270.48$      Winchester Q4170 / 500 170.80$        

45 Auto, 230gr, JHP Remington 29453 / 500 350.00$        No Bid Federal
P45HST1 / 

1,000
499.00$         

Hornady 

Critical 

Duty

90925 / 500 355.47$      Winchester RA45T / 500 240.85$        

45 Auto, 230gr, JHP, 

Bonded
Remington 29416 / 500 445.00$        Speer

53966 / 

1,000
499.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

223/5.56, 55gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE223JX / 500 259.00$         
Hornady 

Training
80275 / 500 316.85$      Winchester

USA223R1K / 

Q3131K / 1,000
457.95$        

223/5.56, 55gr. Ballistic Tip No Bid No Bid Federal T223T / 500 435.00$         
Hornady 

TAP 
83276 / 200 174.54$      Winchester

RA223BSTAY / 

1,000
911.90$        

223/5.56, 55gr, Soft Point No Bid No Bid Federal T223A / 500 325.00$         
Hornady 

Training
80255 / 500 316.85$      Winchester

RA223RY / 

1,000
679.30$        

223/5.56, 62gr, TCMC No Bid No Bid Federal AE223N / 500 264.00$         
Hornady 

Frontier

FR260 / 

500
DiscontinuedWinchester

USA223R3 / 

1,000
533.83$        

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

NO AWARD

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Description

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady

2

mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com
mailto:Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com
mailto:Precdelta@tecinfo.com
mailto:Precdelta@tecinfo.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com
mailto:Precdelta@tecinfo.com


Solicitation 47

Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

223/5.56, 62gr, Hollow 

Point, Match Grade
No Bid Speer

24445SP / 

500
325.00$        No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
83285 / 200 174.54$      No Bid

223/5.56, 64gr, Soft Point, 

Match Grade, Bonded
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA556B / 1,000 1,182.63$     

223/5.56, 64gr, FMJ

308, 168gr, Hollow Point, 

Match Grade, Boat tail
No Bid No Bid Federal

GM308M-500 / 

500
575.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
80715 / 200 275.26$      Winchester S308M / 200 256.80$        

12 gauge, Skeet #9, Heavy 

Load, 2-3/4" plastic hull
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AAM129 / 250 107.80$        

12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-

Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull
Remington 20812 / 250 235.00$        No Bid Federal

LE127-00 / 

250
199.00$         No Bid Winchester XB1200 / 250 169.24$        

12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-

Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull
Winchester

RA1200HD / 

250
740.47$        

12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 8-

Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull
Remington

R20804 / 

250
420.00$        No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
86275 / 100 104.60$      No Bid

12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-

Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, 

Reduced coil
Remington 20643 / 250 217.00$        No Bid Federal

LE132-00 / 

250
199.00$         No Bid Winchester

RA1200 / 

RA12005 / 250
169.86$        

12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 8-

Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, 

Reduced coil
Remington 20645 / 250 230.00$        No Bid Federal

LE133-00 / 

250
199.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
86265 / 100 89.37$        Winchester

RA12008 / 

RA120085 / 

250

169.86$        

12 gauge, Rifled Slug, 1 

oz., HP, 2-3/4" plastic hull
No Bid No Bid Federal

LEB127-RS / 

250
205.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
86235 / 100 158.49$      Winchester X12RS15 / 250 176.82$        

12 gauge, Rifled Slug, 1 

oz., Hollow Point , 2-3/4" 

plastic hull, Reduced coil

No Bid No Bid Federal
LE127-RS / 

250
205.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
86285 / 100 147.66$      Winchester

RA12RS15 / 

250
176.82$        

NO AWARD

Descriptio4

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
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Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

Label, Cont., Prescrip, PHA-

20-8, 1-7/8" x 1-7/8"

9mm Luger, 147gr, FMJ, 

Training Ammo
No Bid Speer

53620 / 

1,000
249.00$        Federal AE9FP / 1,000 249.00$         No Bid Winchester

USA9MM1 / 

500
140.26$        

223/5.56, 62gr, Soft Point No Bid Speer 24446 / 500 325.00$        Federal LE223T3 / 200 245.00$         No Bid No Bid

308, 150gr, Soft Point No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA3085 / 200 182.51$        

380 Auto, 95gr, Ranger T-

Series, JHP
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

Critical 

Defense

90080 / 250 209.10$      Winchester RA380T / 500 209.49$        

38 Special, +P, 130gr, 

Ranger Bonded, JHP
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA38B / 500 259.07$        

9mm, 147gr, Ranger 

Bonded, Cavity Filled
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9B1 / 500 276.32$        

9mm, 147gr, Ranger 

Bonded, JHP
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9B / 500 240.98$        

9mm, +P+, 127gr, Ranger 

T-Series, JHP
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9TA / 500 192.10$        

40 S&W, 180gr, Ranger 

Bonded, Cavity Filled
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA40B1 / 500 319.21$        

45 Auto, 230gr, Ranger 

Bonded, Cavity Filled
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA45B1 / 500 373.81$        

45 Auto, +P, 230gr, Ranger 

T-Series, JHP
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA45TP / 500 246.25$        

9mm, +P, 100gr, Frangible-

Sinterfire Lead Free
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9SF / 500 240.30$        

9mm, +P, 90gr, Frangible-

Sinterfire Lead Free
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9SF1 / 500 230.97$        

9mm, 90gr, Frangible-

Cesaroni Lead Free
No Bid No Bid No Bid Hornady 90230 / 500 264.07$      Winchester USA9F / 500 227.45$        

380 Auto, 95gr, FMJ No Bid Speer
53608 / 

1,000
335.00$        Federal

AE380AP / 

1,000
350.00$         No Bid Winchester Q4206 / 500 135.56$        

NO AWARD

Descriptio4

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com
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Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

9mm NATO, 124gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9124N / 500 130.78$        

223 Rem, 64gr, Ranger 

Patrol Rifle-PowerPoint
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester

RA223R2Y / 

1,000
661.93$        

223 Rem, 69gr, Match-

Hollow Point Boat tail
No Bid No Bid Federal

GM223M-500 / 

500
475.00$         No Bid Winchester

RA223MY / 

1,000
867.04$        

223 Rem, 55gr, Frangible-

Sinterfire Lead Free
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester

RA223SFY / 

1,000
848.49$        

5.56mm, 77gr, Match-

Hollow Point Tail
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 

8126N / 

200
174.54$      Winchester

RA556M / 

1,000
896.36$        

223 Rem, 55gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE223X / 500 259.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 

Training

80271 / 500 209.17$      Winchester
USA223R1K / 

1,000
457.95$        

223 Rem, 55gr, FMJ, 

Product W223K
No Bid No Bid Federal

AE223BKX / 

1,000
Discontinued No Bid Winchester W223K / 1,000 457.95$        

5.56mm, 55gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal XM193X / 500 Discontinued

Hornady 

TAP 

Training

81278 / 500 209.17$      Winchester Q3131K / 1,000 457.95$        

6.5 Creedmoor, 140gr, 

Match-Hollow Point Boat 

tail

No Bid No Bid Federal
GM65CRD1 / 

200
280.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
81505 / 200 300.10$      Winchester S65CM / 200 385.00$        

6.5 Creedmoor, 142gr, 

Accubond Long Range
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
81485 / 200 373.51$      Winchester S65LR / 200 450.00$        

6.5 Creedmoor, 125gr, 

Extreme Point Polymer Tip
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester S65DS / 200 420.00$        

308 Win, 150gr, Ranger 

Patrol Rifle-PowerPoint
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
80905 / 200 275.26$      Winchester RA3085 / 200 181.11$        

308 Win, 168gr, Supreme 

Ballistic Silver Tip
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
80965 / 200 275.26$      Winchester

SBST308A / 

200
265.27$        

308 Win, 168gr, Ranger 

Bonded
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
80985 / 200 416.00$      Winchester RA308B / 200 353.28$        

Description

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
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Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

300 Blackout, 125gr, Open 

Tip
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
80875 / 200 DiscontinuedWinchester

USA300BLK / 

200
135.80$        

308 Win, 147gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester USA3081 / 200 163.68$        

7.62 x 51mm, 147gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester Q3130 / 200 185.89$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 325gr, 

Frangible-Lead Free Slug, 

Low Recoil

No Bid No Bid Federal
BC127-RS / 

250
450.00$         

Hornady 

TAP 
86245 / 100 209.21$      Winchester

RA12RSSF / 

250
486.08$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, 

9-Pellet, Frangible-Lead 

Free 
Remington 20805 / 250 420.00$        No Bid Federal

BC132-00 / 

250
340.00$         No Bid Winchester

RA1200SF / 

250
420.24$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1 oz., 

Segmented Rifle Slug
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester

RA12RS15S / 

250
187.71$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, 

9-Pellet-Low Recoil
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester

RA1200 / 

RA12005 / 250
169.86$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, 

8-Pellet-Low Recoil
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester

RA12008 / 

RA120085 / 

250

169.86$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, 

9-Pellet
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester XB1200 / 250 169.24$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, 

9-Pellet
Winchester

RA1200HD / 

250
185.12$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., 

3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot-

Super Handicap

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AAHA127 / 250 111.73$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., 

2-3/4 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 

Shot - Light Target

No Bid No Bid Federal

TGL12-8 or 

TGL12-7.5 / 

250

105.00$         No Bid Winchester AA128 / 250 111.73$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., 

1-3/4 Dram - #8 Shot - 

Reduced Coil

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AA12FL8 / 250 111.73$        

Description

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order
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Solicitation 47

Price per Case

Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds 

per Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ 

Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case Mfg/Brand 

Name

Mfg#/ Rounds per 

Case

Price/Case

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., 

3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot - 

Heavy Target

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester
AAM127 or 

AAM128 / 250
112.97$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., 

3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot - 

Light Target

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester
AA127 or 

AA128 / 250
112.97$        

12 gauge, 2-3/4", Field 

Trail Popper - Blank
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester XP12 / 250 156.82$        

Hornady, 308 Win, 168gr, 

Eld Match Tap
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hornady 

TAP 
80725 / 200 468.64$      No Bid

Description

Effective:  January 23, 

2024

Remington Speer Federal Hornady Winchester

Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors GT Distributors Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3 Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity:  3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months
Estimated delivery - to be determined at time 

of order
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