Solicitation 47
Price per Box

Description
Effective: January 23,
2024

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors*

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order
Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box
R29401 / O

357 Magnum, 125gr, JHP  [Remington 50 $ 40.50 (No Bid No Bid Critical Winchester X3576P /50 | $ 25.55
Duty

857 SIG, 125gr, JHP, No Bid Speer 53919/50 | $  18.50 |Federal |AE357SA/50|$ 2475 |HOmady Winchester | USASSTSIHP /¢ 6 59

Training Ammo Training 50
Hornady

:I;i:ufelfj; 125gr, JHP, No Bid Speer 53918 /50 | $ 21.25 [No Bid Critical Winchester | RA357SSB /50 | $ 36.14
Duty

38 Special, 130gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE38K /50 |$ 20.75 |No Bid Winchester Q4171 /50 $ 16.22
Hornady

38 Special, 125gr, +P, JHP [Remington |29431/50 | $ 29.50 |Speer 53720/50 | $ 24.25 [No Bid Critical Winchester | X38S7PH /50 | $ 19.87
Defense

38 Special, Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester 38SBLP/50 | $ 26.50
Hornady

9mm Luger, 115gr, FMJ No Bid Speer 53650/50 | $ 12.95 |Federal AE9DP /50 | $ 12.95 |TAP Winchester Q4172 /50 $ 12.60
Training

omm Luger, 124gr, FMJ, 1\ gig Speer 53651/50 [$  12.95 |Federal AE9AP /50 |$ 12,95 |Homady Winchester | USAIMM /50 |3 12.86

Training Ammo Training
Hornady

9mm Luger, 124gr, JHP Remington | 29357/50 | $ 28.50 [Speer 53618 /50 | $ 20.50 |Federal PO9HST1/50 | $ 20.50 |Critical No Bid
Duty
Hornady

9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, JHP|Remington | 29358/50 | $ 28.50 [No Bid Federal P9HST3/50 | $ 20.50 |Critical Winchester | RA9124TP /50 | $ 18.89
Duty

9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, . . . .

JHP, Bonded Remington |[29351/50 | $ 37.50 [Speer 53617 /50 | $ 20.50 [No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9BA / 50 $ 23.70

gr;?;:;ger’ 14791, JHP. - Remington |29353/50|$  37.50 |Speer 53619/50 | $ 2050 |No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA9B/50 |$  24.10

;l:(,\’A"J‘m Semi-auto, 18091, 1\ gid No Bid Federal AE10A/50 |$  23.75 |No Bid Winchester | USAIOMM /50 |$  24.14

40 _S&W,lGSgr, FMJ, No Bid Speer 53955/50 | $ 14.75 |Federal AE40R3/50 | $ 15.75 |No Bid Winchester | USA40SW /50 | $ 14.41

Training Ammo
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Price per Box

Description
Effective: January 23,
2024

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box
. R29429 / : . :

40 S&W,165gr, JHP Remington 5 $  31.60 |No Bid Federal  |P40HST3/50|$ 22.50 |No Bid Winchester | RA40TA/50 |$ 21.04

g(;r]sdgé\év,lesgr, IHP, Remington |29366/50 |$  39.60 [Speer 53970/50 | $  22.00 |No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA40BA/50 |$ 25.88

SR, SR (U No Bid Speer 53652/50 | $  14.75 |Federal AE40R1/50 | $ 15,55 || SOTECL Winchester | Q4238/50 |s$ 15.10

Training Ammo Training

R29430 / Hornady

40 S&W 180gr, JHP Remington 50 $ 39.60 [No Bid Federal P40HST1/50| $ 22.50 [Critical Winchester RA40T /50 | $ 21.15
Duty

g(()mscfé\év 180gr, JHP, Remington |29436/50|$  31.60 [Speer 53962/50 |$  23.50 |No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA40B/50 |$ 25.60

45 Auto, 185gr, FMJ, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | USA45A/50 |$  16.92

Training Ammo

45 Auto, 185gr, +P, JHP  |Remington |29457/50|$  35.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 Auto, 185gr, +P, JHP, NO AWARD

Bonded

448 LI, T, (A No Bid Speer 53653/50 | $  19.45 |Federal AE45A/50 |$ 19,05 |Hormady Winchester | Q4170/50 |$  17.08

Training Ammo Training
Hornady

45 Auto, 230gr, JHP Remington |29453/50|$  35.00 [No Bid Federal  |P45HST1/50|$ 24.95 |Critical Winchester | RA45T/50 |$ 24.09
Duty

gi rﬁj”;g’ 230gr, JHP, Remington |29416/50|$  44.50 |Speer 53966/50 | $  24.95 |No Bid No Bid No Bid

. . Hornady . USA223R1K /

223/5.56, 55¢gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE223JX/20 | $ 10.36 Training Winchester 03131K / 20 $ 9.16

223/5.56, 55gr. Ballistic Tip |No Bid No Bid Federal T223T/20 |$ 17.40 ';'Xg‘ady Winchester RA223ZBOSTAY/ $ 18.24

223/5.56, 55gr, Soft Point  [No Bid No Bid Federal T223A120 |$ 13.00 ':f;l:?rfg Winchester | RA223RY /20 |$ 13.59

223/5.56, 62gr, TCMC No Bid No Bid Federal AE223N /20 | $ 10.56 ';:’c::sgg’ Winchester | USA223R3/20 | $ 10.68
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Price per Box

Descriptio4
Effective: January 23,
2024

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box

223/5.56, 62gr, Hollow . 24445SP | . Hornady .
Point, Match Grade No Bid Speer 20 $ 13.00 |No Bid TAP No Bid
223/5.56, 64gr, Soft Point, . . . : .
Vi Gl ke No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA556B/20 | $ 23.65
223/5.56, 64gr, FMJ NO AWARD
308, 168gr, Hollow Point, . . GM308M-500 / Hornady .
N Gl st e No Bid No Bid Federal 20 $ 23.00 TAP Winchester S308M / 20 $ 25.68
12 gauge, Skeet #9, Heavy . . . . .
Load, 2-3/4" plastic hull No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AAM129/25 |$ 10.78
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9- . . . .
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull Remington [20812/25| $ 23.50 |No Bid Federal LE127-00/5 | $ 3.98 |No Bid Winchester XB1200 /5 $ 3.39
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9- .
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull Winchester | RA1200HD /25 | $ 18.51
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 8- . R20804 / . . Hornady .
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull | Remington op ||P AP e No Bid TAP No Bid
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, Remington |[20643/25|$ 21.70 |No Bid Federal LE132-00/5 | $ 3.98 [No Bid Winchester RA1200/25 ($ 16.99
Reduced coll
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, Winchester RA12005/5 |$ 3.38
Reduced coll
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 8- Hornad
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, Remington |[20645/25| $ 23.00 |No Bid Federal LE133-00/5 | $ 3.98 TAP y Winchester | RA12008/25 |$ 16.99
Reduced coil
12 gauge, 00 Buckshot, 8-
Pellet, 2-3/4" plastic hull, Winchester RA120085/5 | $ 3.37
Reduced coll
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Price per Box

Description
Effective: January 23,
2024

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box
12 gauge, Rifled Slug, 1 . . Hornady .
0z., HP, 2-3/4" plastic hull No Bid No Bid Federal LEB127-RS /5| $ 4.10 TAP Winchester X12RS15/5 |$ 3.54
12 gauge, Rifled Slug, 1 Hornad
0z., Hollow Point , 2-3/4" No Bid No Bid Federal LE127-RS/5 | $ 4.10 TAP Y Winchester RA12RS15/5 | $ 3.54
plastic hull, Reduced coil
Label, Cont., Prescrip, PHA-
20-8, 1-7/8" x 1-7/8" NO AWARD
S0 (VST Sl [7055h g, Speer 53620/50 | $  12.45 |Federal AE9FP/50 |$  12.45 |No Bid Winchester | USAOMM1/50 |$  14.03
Training Ammo
223/5.56, 62gr, Soft Point  |No Bid Speer 24446120 $ 13.00 |Federal LE223T3/20 | $ 24.50 |No Bid No Bid
308, 150gr, Soft Point No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA3085/20 |$ 18.25
Hornady
380 Auto, 95gr, Ranger T- |, g;q No Bid No Bid Critical Winchester | RA380T/50 |$  20.95
Series, JHP
Defense
38 Special, +P, 130gr, . . . . .
Ranger Bonded, JHP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA38B / 50 $ 25.91
9mm, 147gr, Ranger . . . . .
Bonded, Cavity Filled No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9B1 /50 $ 27.63
9mm, 147gr, Ranger . . . . .
Bonded, JHP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9B / 50 $ 24.10
mm, +P+, 127gr, Ranger |\, giq No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA9TA/50 |$  19.21
T-Series, JHP
40 S&W, 180gr, Ranger |, g;q No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA40B1/50 |$  31.92
Bonded, Cavity Filled
45 Auto, 230gr, Ranger . . . . .
Bonded. Cavity Filled No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA45B1/50 | $ 37.38
45 Auto, +P, 230gr, Ranger |\, g;q No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA45TP/50 |$  24.62
T-Series, JHP
mm, +P, 100gr, Frangible- | g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA9SF/50 |$ 24.03
Sinterfire Lead Free
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Price per Box

Descriptio4
Effective: January 23,
2023

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box

9mm, +P, 90gr, Frangible- |\, gjq No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA9SF1/50 |$  23.10

Sinterfire Lead Free

omm, QQgr, Frangible- No Bid No Bid No Bid Hornady Winchester USA9F / 50 $ 22.75

Cesaroni Lead Free

380 Auto, 95gr, FMJ No Bid Speer 53608 /50 | $ 16.75 |Federal AE380AP /50| $ 17.50 |No Bid Winchester Q4206 / 50 $ 13.56

9mm NATO, 124gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester RA9124N /50 | $ 13.08

223 Rem, 64gr, Ranger | g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA223R2Y/20 |$  13.24

Patrol Rifle-PowerPaoint

223 Rem, 69gr, Match- 1 g No Bid Federal  |CM223M-500/| ¢ 19.00 |No Bid Winchester | RA223MY /20 |$ 17.34

Hollow Point Boat tail 20

223 Rem, 55gr, Frangible- {0 ;4 No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA223sFY /20 |$  16.97

Sinterfire Lead Free

5.56mm, 77gr, Match- . . . Hornady .

Hollow Point Tail No Bid No Bid No Bid TAP Winchester RA556M /20 | $ 17.93
Hornady

223 Rem, 55gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal AE223X /20 | $ 10.36 |TAP Winchester [USA223R1K /20| $ 9.16
Training

223 Rem, 55gr, FMJ, . . AE223BKX / . . . .

Product W223K No Bid No Bid Federal 1,000 Discontinued |No Bid Winchester W223K /20 $ 9.16
Hornady

5.56mm, 55gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid Federal XM193X /20 | Discontinued |TAP Winchester Q3131K/20 |$ 9.16
Training

6.5 Creedmoor, 140gr, . . GM65CRD1 / Hornady .

Match-Hollow Point Boat tail No Bid No Bid Federal 20 $ 28.00 TAP Winchester S65CM / 20 $ 38.50

6.5 Creedmoor, 142gr, . . . Hornady .

Accubond Long Range No Bid No Bid No Bid TAP Winchester S65LR / 20 $ 45.00

6.5 Creedmoor, 125gr, |\, gig No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | S65DS/20 |$  42.00

Extreme Point Polymer Tip

308 Win, 150gr, Ranger . . . Hornady .

Patrol Rifle-PowerPoint No Bid No Bid No Bid TAP Winchester RA3085 / 20 $ 18.11
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Price per Box

Description
Effective: January 23,
2023

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box

308 Win, 168gr, Supreme . . ) Hornady .
Ballistic Silver Tip No Bid No Bid No Bid TAP Winchester | SBST308A/20 | $ 26.57
308 Win, 168gr, Ranger |, gjq No Bid No Bid IIEDE Winchester | RA308B/20 |$ 3533
Bonded TAP
300 Blackout, 125gr, Open | gig No Bid No Bid Hornady gog7s [P0t Nwinchester |UsA3ooBLK/20|$  13.58
Tip TAP Submit
308 Win, 147gr, FMJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester USA3081/20 | $ 16.37
7.62 x 51mm, 147gr, FMJ |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester Q3130/20 $ 18.59
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 325¢r,
Frangible-Lead Free Slug, |No Bid No Bid Federal BC12275 RS $ 45.00 ?z:anady Winchester | RA12RSSF /25 | $ 48.61
Low Recoil
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck,
9-Pellet, Frangible-Lead Remington |[20805/25| $ 42.00 |No Bid Federal BC132-00/25( $ 34.00 |No Bid Winchester | RA1200SF /25 | $ 42.02
Free
12 gauge, 2:3/4", Loz, |\ g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA12RS15S /5 | $ 3.75
Segmented Rifle Slug
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, |\, g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA1200/25 |$  16.99
9-Pellet-Low Recoil
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, .
9-Pellet-Low Recoil Winchester RA12005/5 | $ 3.38
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, |\, g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | RA12008/25 |$  16.99
8-Pellet-Low Recoil
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 00 Buck, .
8-Pellet-Low Recoil Winchester RA120085/5 | $ 3.37
;_Zpge";‘lzge’ 2314, 00 Buck, |\5 gig No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | XB1200/5 |$ 3.39
Seuge, 2-8/4%, 00 Buck, Winchester | RAL1200HD /25 |$ 1851
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Price per Box

Description
Effective: January 23,
2023

Remington

Speer

Federal

Hornady

Winchester

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

Gulf States Distributors

GT Distributors

Precision Delta Corp.

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com

Juan.Montalvo@gtdist.com

Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 14 months

Estimated delivery - 6 to 12 months

Estimated delivery - to be determined at time

of order

Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Price/Box Mfg/Brand Mfg#/ Rounds per |Price/Box
Name Rounds per Name Rounds per Name per Box Name Rounds per Name Box
Box Box Box
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz.,
3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot- |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AAHA127/25 | $ 11.30
Super Handicap
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., TGL12-8 or
2-3/4 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 No Bid No Bid Federal TGL12-75/ | $ 10.50 |No Bid Winchester AA128 /25 $ 11.17
Shot - Light Target 25
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz.,
1-3/4 Dram - #8 Shot - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester AA12FL8/25 | $ 11.17
Reduced Coil
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz., . . ) . . AAM127 or
3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot - [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester $ 11.30
AAM128 / 25
Heavy Target
12 gauge, 2-3/4", 1-1/8 oz.,
3 Dram - #7-1/2 or 8 Shot - |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester |AAT27 O A28 g 1107
Light Target
12 gauge, 2-3/4" Field Trail | g No Bid No Bid No Bid Winchester | xP12/25 |$ 1568
Popper - Blank
Hornady, 308 Win, 168gr, . . . Hornady .
Eld Match Tap No Bid No Bid No Bid TAP No Bid
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