

AASIS Material Number	Description	Remington		Speer		Federal		Winchester	
		Galls,LLC		Gulf States Distributors		Gulf States Distributors		Precision Delta Corp.	
		brewer-tiffany@galls.com		Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com		Tommy@gulfstatesdist.com		Precdelta@tecinfo.com	
		Minimum Case Quantity: <u>3</u>		Minimum Case Quantity: <u>1</u>		Minimum Case Quantity: <u>1</u>		Minimum Case Quantity: <u>3</u>	
		Mfg.#	Price/M	Mfg.#	Price/M	Mfg.#	Price/M	Mfg.#	Price/M
10100060	357 Magnum, 125gr, Jacketed Hollow Point	29400	\$326.00	53920	Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid	X3576P	\$376.04
10100062	357 SIG, 125gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23734	\$281.00	53919	\$ 269.00	No Bid	No Bid	Q4309	\$357.14
10100061	357 SIG, 125gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29408	\$378.00	53918	\$ 409.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA357SB	\$487.39
10100063	38 Special, 130gr, Full Metal Jacket	23730	\$255.00	No Bid	No Bid	AE38K	\$ 349.00	Q4171	\$263.64
10100064	38 Special, 125gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point	29431	\$309.00	53722	\$ 389.00	No Bid	No Bid	X38S7PH	\$305.66
10100065	38 Special, Blank	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	38SBLP	\$499.99
10100066	9mm Luger, 115gr, Full Metal Jacket	23728	\$181.00	53650	Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid	Q4172	\$189.60
10124520	9mm Luger, 124gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23718	\$220.00	53651	\$ 199.00	No Bid	No Bid	USA9MM	\$191.16
10100067	9mm Luger, 124gr, Jacketed Hollow Point	29357	\$345.00	No Bid	No Bid	P9HST1	\$ 289.00	No Bid	No Bid
10100068	9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point	29358	\$351.00	No Bid	No Bid	P9HST3	\$ 289.00	RA9124TP	\$287.18
10100069	9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29351	\$361.00	53617	\$ 325.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA9BA	\$369.74
10126760	9mm Luger, 147gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23732	\$231.00	53620	\$ 199.00	No Bid	No Bid	USA9MM1	\$221.62
10100070	9mm Luger, 147gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29353	\$356.00	53619	\$ 325.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA9B	\$369.74
10100071	10mm Semi-auto, 180gr, Full Metal Jacket	23706	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid	AE10A	\$ 479.00	No Bid	No Bid
10100073	40 S&W, 165gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23746	\$272.00	53955	\$ 239.00	No Bid	No Bid	USA40SW	\$218.48
10100074	40 S&W, 165gr, Jacketed Hollow Point	29429	\$321.00	No Bid	No Bid	P40HST3	\$ 329.00	RA40TA	\$310.92
10124521	40 S&W, 165gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29366	\$402.00	53970	\$ 345.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA40BA	\$371.84
10126761	40 S&W, 180gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23742	\$261.00	53652	\$ 239.00	No Bid	No Bid	Q4238	\$230.04
10126762	40 S&W, 180gr, Jacketed Hollow Point	29430	\$328.00	No Bid	No Bid	P40HST1	\$ 329.00	RA40T	\$310.92
10100075	40 S&W, 180gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29436	\$355.00	53962	\$ 345.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA40B	\$373.30
10124522	45 Auto, 185gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23818	\$272.00	53654	Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid	USA45A	\$251.04
10100078	45 Auto, 185gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point	29457	\$354.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10126764	45 Auto, 185gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29414	\$475.00	53964	Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10100076	45 Auto, 230gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo	23726	\$261.00	No Bid	No Bid	AE45A	\$ 279.00	Q4170	\$267.84
10100077	45 Auto, 230gr, Jacketed Hollow Point	29453	\$381.00	No Bid	No Bid	P45HST2	\$ 369.00	RA45T	\$359.24
10100079	45 Auto, 230gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded	29416	\$410.00	53966	\$ 395.00	No Bid	No Bid	RA45B	\$446.42
10100080	223/5.56, 55gr, Full Metal Jacket	237	\$291.00	No Bid	No Bid	XM193	\$ 338.00	Q3131	\$320.37
10124523	223/5.56, 55gr, Ballistic Tip	29192	\$525.00	No Bid	No Bid	T223T	\$ 558.00	RA223BSTAY	\$734.23
10124524	223/5.56, 55gr, Soft Point	28399	\$370.00	No Bid	No Bid	T223A	\$ 418.00	RA223RY	\$512.60
10126766	223/5.56, 62gr, Full Metal Jacket	23815		No Bid	No Bid	AE223N	\$358.00	USA223R3	\$407.56
10100081	223/5.56, 62gr, Hollow Point, Match Grade	22106	\$326.00	No Bid	No Bid	GM223M	Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid
10126767	223/5.56, 62gr, Soft Point, Match Grade, Bonded	28918	\$554.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE223T3	\$ 995.00	RA556B	\$761.54
10100083	308, 150gr, Soft Point	27842	\$659.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE308T1	\$ 1145.00	X3085	\$764.70
10100084	308, 168gr, Hollow Point, Match Grade, Boat-tail	21485	\$694.00	No Bid	No Bid	GM308M-500	\$ 776.00	S308M	\$879.20
10100085	12ga, Skeet #9, Heavy Load, 2-3/4 plastic hull	20116	\$377.00	No Bid	No Bid	TGL12#9	\$ 300.00	AAM129	\$307.76
10100088	12ga, 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull	20812	\$472.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE127-00	\$ 518.00	XB1200	\$472.68
10124525	12ga, 00 Buckshot, 8 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull	20662	\$472.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10100089	12ga, 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull, Reduced Recoil	20643	\$472.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE132-00	\$ 518.00	RA12005	\$444.32

10100090	12ga, 00 Buckshot, 8 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull, Reduced Recoil	20645	\$472.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE133-00	\$ 518.00	RA120085	\$435.28
10100091	12ga, Rifled Slug, 1 oz, Hollow Point, 2-3/4 plastic hull	20279	\$400.00	No Bid	No Bid	F127-RS	\$ 516.00	X12RS15	\$493.04
10100092	12ga,Rifled Slug,1oz,Foster slug,2-3/4 plastic hull, Red. Recoil	20285	\$450.00	No Bid	No Bid	LE127-RS	\$ 558.00	RA12RS15	\$495.76

Contract Contact Information

Contract No: 4600045422

Brand: Remington

Galls, LLC, Vendor No: 100234149
Tiffany Brewer brewer-tiffany@galls.com
1340 Russell Cave Road Lexington, KY 40505
Phone No: 859.800.1406 | Fax 877.914.2557

Contract No: 4600033839 Contract No: 4600033834

Brand: Federal and Speer

Gulf States Distributors, Inc., Vendor No: 100145319
Tommy Trammell Tommy@gulfstatesdist.co
6000 E. Shirley Lane Montgomery, AL 36117
Phone No: 800-223-7869 | Fax No: 334-279-9267

Contract No: 4600033830

Brand: Winchester

Precision Delta Corp, Vendor No: 100149868
Patricia Lott Precdelta@tecinfo.com
P.O. Box 128 Ruleville, MS 38771
Phone: 662-756-2810 | Fax: 662-753-2590

PRICES: The price per thousand rounds quoted **will** be the “Normal Inside Delivery” prices.

****Prices quoted do not include any federal excise taxes.***

MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY: Order quantities **will** be “Full” cases and unless otherwise noted the minimum order quantity **will** be as follows:

Galls, LLC - Three (3) Cases

Gulf State Dist. - One (1) Case

Precision Delta Corporation - Three (3) Cases

****Items may be combined to satisfy the minimum order quantity.***

DELIVERY: Items are to be delivered (FOB Destination –Normal Inside Delivery) to the location specified. “Normal Inside Delivery” is defined in this contact as: “The inside delivery to a building with an accessible loading dock to a specific room or area.

****Entities are encouraged to check with the vendor prior to ordering to ascertain any possible additional delivery charge amount that does not fall into the “Normal Inside Delivery” quote.***